
Paul V. Sheridan

From: Nancy Fancy pants <Nmbouch@yahoo.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 08, 2015 9:13 PM
To: Paul V. Sheridan
Subject: Re: VW Oil

Wow! Thank you very much. The ignition coil was replaced but they bought junk yard parts I believe. We'll have that to look 
forward to.  

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 8, 2015, at 9:03 PM, Paul V. Sheridan <pvsheridan@wowway.com> wrote: 

It’s in, works fine (new alt, new tensioner and new belt): 

http://pvsheridan.com/DSCN0931.JPG 

I took a zillion photos, here’s more: 

Rotated tires: 

http://pvsheridan.com/DSCN0907.JPG 

Fixed muffler rattle: 

http://pvsheridan.com/DSCN0917.JPG 

New air filter 

http://pvsheridan.com/DSCN0930.JPG 

Changed oil and filter as well  . . .  

http://pvsheridan.com/DSCN0928.JPG 

The ignition coil is going bad . . . tower three intermittent on coil pack causes periodic misfire in 
cylinder #3. . . there was a recall on these ages ago, but this one looks original (never got 
updated) .  These are ~$100 at Rock. Will fail eventually . . . (Sorry  ) 

From: Nancy Fancy pants [mailto:Nmbouch@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Sunday, July 05, 2015 10:10 PM 
To: Paul V. Sheridan 
Subject: Re: VW Oil 

Hi, yes we're having a wonderful time so far. Mario said he hasn't changed the oil. Thanks. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 5, 2015, at 9:30 PM, Paul V. Sheridan <pvsheridan@wowway.com> wrote: 

Nancy: 

Attachment 1



Just in case you check your email while enjoying the Connect-tie-Cut . . . ask Dana or 
Mario how many times they have changed the oil on the VW since purchase . . .  

Paul 
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ATTACHMENT 6 

This attachment describes the true reason the Bouchards did not solicit (as required under the TSB) the 
commercial vehicle parking waiver approval of Mr. Sheridan, their next door neighbor of 28 years.  These 
five pages document the materials that were returned to Mr. Sheridan on Thursday July 30, 2015.   This took place 
while Mr. Sheridan was not at home after the following event: 

At 5pm on Thursday, July 30, 2015, Mr. Mario Bouchard launched into violent yelling and screaming, at 
Mr. Sheridan, in response to the last two pages of this attachment: A polite request for reimbursement. 

First Page of this Attachment 

Contains handwritten Bouchard note with the acronym  “WWJD.”    This is a grotesque affront to, not only Mr. 
Sheridan’s religious beliefs, which are well-known to Bouchard, but it represents a vane personal abuse of the 
Lord’s name over money:  For the record, there was no such day as “Monday Aug. 2” in 2015. 

Second Page of this Attachment 

Envelope taped to the side door of the Sheridan residence at 22357 Columbia Street, Dearborn, MI, containing 
items that related to the repair of the Dayna Bouchard Volkswagen.  (The envelope included a meal replacement 
bar offered to Bouchard in-friendship by Mr. Sheridan.) 

Third Page of this Attachment 

Cell telephone record to Bouchard residence.  Mr. Sheridan was attempting to politely inquire about belated 
payment of parts-only reimbursement (for Bouchard daughter’s Volkswagen, see photo on page 3 of cover letter).  

On Saturday 7/25 and Monday 7/27, calls were attempted while all Bouchard vehicles were present.  But with the 
Sheridan caller ID unmasked, there was no answer. 

Another attempt was made to the Bouchard land line (313-274-3979) on “Thursday 7/30.”  With the Sheridan 
caller ID unmasked there was still no answer.    Later, on that same day, the second attempt was answered but 
presumably because the caller ID was  masked : 

After twenty minutes of listening to Mrs. Nancy Bouchard’s machinations about upcoming lawyer expenses 
to fund another  ‘Personal Protection Order’ (PPO for daughter Kimberly),  “budget issues,”  “piles of bills,” 
etc.,  Mr. Sheridan did not demand payment, but instead politely stated: 

“Please do the best you can.” 

Last Two Pages of this Attachment 

Sheridan’s polite reminder note was dropped off at Bouchard residence on Thursday July 30, 2015.  This note was 
discussed for 20 minutes with Mrs. Bouchard.   See telephone record, listed as  “2:33pm Thursday 7/30.”   

Upon his reading this note, rather than acting as a neighbor and a gentleman, Mr. Bouchard launched into violent 
yelling and screaming across the fence at Mr. Sheridan.  He did this prior to conferring with Mrs. Bouchard. 

Later that evening, knowing the Mr. Sheridan was not at-home, Mr. Bouchard trespassed onto Mr. Sheridan’s 
property and then sneakily plastered  the  “WWJD”  note to Sheridan side door . 
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PAUL V. SHERIDAN Page:
07/12/15 - 08/11/15Bill Cycle Date:22357 COLUMBIA ST

Account:DEARBORN, MI 48124-3431 691872869

www.att.comVisit us online at:

607 280-9790
PAUL V. SHERIDAN

Call Detail

Place Rate Feature Airtime LD/Addl
Time Called Number Called Code Code Min Charges Charges
Monday, 07/13
03:16p ITHACA NY 607-257-2000 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
08:32p DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 3 0.00 0.00
Tuesday, 07/14
11:37a DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
11:38a DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
Wednesday, 07/15
11:07a ITHACA NY 607-274-9242 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
11:49a ITHACA NY 607-274-9242 RM45 10 0.00 0.00
12:57p ROYAL  MI 248-548-3557 RM45 2 0.00 0.00
Thursday, 07/16
12:08p FRONTR VA 540-635-7607 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
12:08p MIDDLE VA 540-454-2161 MME0 M2MC 18 0.00 0.00
03:25p DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 3 0.00 0.00
07:55p WALTHA MA 781-647-0622 RM45 42 0.00 0.00
Friday, 07/17
12:02p ITHACA NY 607-274-9242 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
Tuesday, 07/21
12:05p ITHACA NY 607-274-9242 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
03:08p DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
Wednesday, 07/22
12:15p ITHACA NY 607-274-9242 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
02:34p DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
04:43p DETROI MI 313-277-5095 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
Friday, 07/24
08:41a DETROI MI 313-274-6784 RM45 2 0.00 0.00
08:42a DETROI MI 313-274-6784 RM45 2 0.00 0.00
Saturday, 07/25
01:14p DETROI MI 313-274-3979 5KNW 1 0.00 0.00
Monday, 07/27
01:05p NEWBRU NJ 908-239-9239 RM45 29 0.00 0.00
06:17p VMAIL  CL 607-280-9790 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
07:37p DETROI MI 313-274-3979 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
Thursday, 07/30
02:33p DETROI MI 313-274-3979 RM45 20 0.00 0.00
04:28p ORANGE NJ 973-243-2099 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
04:29p NEWBRU NJ 908-239-9239 RM45 70 0.00 0.00
Friday, 08/07
11:30a VMAIL  CL 607-280-9790 RM45 1 0.00 0.00
Subtotal 217 0.00 0.00

Rate Code:

=5KNW 5000 Night & Weekend
=MME0 Unltd Mobile to AT&T Mobile
=RM45 450 Anytime w/Rollover

Feature Code:

=M2MC EXPANDED M2M

Data Detail

Time To/From Type/Unit Rate Code
Text Messages
Wednesday, 07/15
04:48p Rcvd 224444       Text Message TMI1O 0.20
Subtotal for Text Messages: 1 0.20
Total Data Detail 0.20

Rate Code:

=TMI1O Pay Per Use Text/Instant Messaging
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PaulVSheridan
Callout
Sheridan telephone ID not masked; no answer

PaulVSheridan
Callout
Sheriidan telephone ID not masked: no answer

PaulVSheridan
Callout
Sheridan telephone ID masked; now receives answer



Dayna/Mario/Nancy: 

My credit card payment check has already gone out, all VW parts 
(alternator, belt, oil, filters, etc.) were listed, I began these 
purchases/orders on July 1.  

So my check for  $282 .34  is needed by Monday, August 3 (see first 
attachment). 

Paul 



Dayna / Nancy / Mario: 

Please review the photos / file cd (two copies). 

Parts only due: 

Alternator $  132 . 61 

Belt and Tensioner       86 . 41 

Oil Dipstick Tube *       11 . 75 

Oil and Air Filter, and oil        39 . 57 

Metric bolt temp dipstick         1 . 00 

Stainless clamps for Muffler rattle fix        3 . 00 

Stainless back-up spring and bolt for Hatch fix        4 . 00 

Two cd’s for photo record           n/c 

TOTAL DUE (check please)    $  278 . 34 

Update (forgot to add the quart for the 
power steering; took WHOLE quart! 
see Sunoco trans fluid bottle in box  
of parts)      4 . 00 

TOTAL DUE (check please)   $  282 . 34 

* May arrive at 22357 Columbia this week; watch (hand delivered)



END OF DOCUMENT 
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